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Answer Two Essay Questions.

Answer 20 MBE Questions.
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QUESTION 1

On January 1, Thomas orally contracted with Ramirez’s County Disposal to pick up her garbage and
recycling, once a week for 1 year for $40 per month. On August 1, Ramirez’s truck fleet experienced
significant mechanical difficulties causing Ramirez to contact its competitor – Lopez’s Collection Services.

Ramirez agreed to pay Lopez $20 per month per customer (including Thomas) and Lopez agreed to do all
the garbage and recycling pickup for Ramirez for all of its customers. Thomas and other customers were not
notified of this change but there garbage and recycling was picked up weekly as scheduled and they
continued to make their payments to Ramirez.

On November 10, the area suffered terrible rains which caused major flooding and landslides and the closure
of the county dump and recycling facilities. The closest dump and recycling facility was in the next county,
approximately 40 miles away, which would double the costs to Lopez. Lopez ceased picking up Thomas’
(and other’s customers) trash and recycling that week and sent out a notice stating:

“Due to the recent storms and doubling of our costs, we will no longer pick-up the trash and recycling of
Ramirez’s customers.”

Thomas retains your law firm.

You may assume a valid offer, acceptance, and consideration exists in the Thomas/Ramirez and
Ramirez/Lopez agreements.

Describe the rights and liabilities of all parties including Thomas, Ramirez, and Lopez.
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Essay Question 2

Kelsey Lawless, an attorney, has recently inherited some rural lake front property which she intends to sell
as soon as possible. Having heard about Minnow’s vending machine (Vend-A-Bait) project and that Minnow
is operating three machines at a lake near her rural property, Lawless called Minnow and told her about her
inheritance. The following oral exchange took place On October 1:

Lawless: For this next month of October, before I sell my property, I’ll supply you with night crawlers
worms for your three Vend-A-Bait machines. My inherited property is rich with worms and will be perfect
for your business. Price is 50 cents a pound. Upon receipt of your orders, I will undertake to fill them
promptly.

Minnow: Sounds good. I’ll let you know exactly how many pounds I need.

A few days later on October 4, the local reservoir over-flowed and covered Lawless’ property as well as
others with four feet of water. Disaster experts say the land will not be usable for six weeks. As a result of
the flooding, worms cannot be collected on Lawless’ land.

On October 4, Minnow mailed a request for 100 pounds of night crawler worms to Lawless, which she
received on October 6. On October 7, Lawless sent a letter to Minnow, explaining what had happened and
revoking her offer to supply worms for her Vend-A-Bail business for the month of October. This letter was
received by Minnow on October 9.

In the meantime, a second letter was sent by Minnow to Lawless on October 8 ordering an additional 100
pounds of night crawler worms. This letter was received by Lawless on October 10. On October 12, Minnow
gave to her son Michael, all of her right, title and interest in the vending machines, including the then
existing outstanding orders for night crawlers.

What is Lawless’ contractual liability with respect to the orders placed by Minnow on October 4 and
October 8? Discuss all issues.

****

Question 3 – MBE Section

Answer in Examsoft
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1. Delegation

a. Discuss delegation from Ramirez to Lopez. Valid?

2. Assignment

a. There is an assignment of the business including accounts receivable and duties to

perform. Valid assignment?

b. Is this a delegation with consideration? Turn it into a 3PB contract. Intended and vested

3PB? Discuss rights and liabilities of 3PB.

3. Statute of Frauds

a. Discuss original contract and 3PB contract.

Contracts Spring 2024 Essay 2 outline

1. Contract formation

a. Offer open, acceptance, consideration

b. termination of offer? Acceptance mail box rule?

2. Discharge of contract

a. Impossibility due to disaster?

3. Assignment?

a. Valid assignment to Michael?




























